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Calvary Assembly of God - Food Distribution Center - Dover
   
Calvary Assembly of God - Food Distribution Center in Dover, Delaware

  The **Calvary Assembly of God** offers a vital service to the community of
Dover, Delaware, through its **Food Distribution Center**. This center is
committed to assisting those in need by providing essential resources in a
welcoming environment.  

Wheelchair-Accessible Facilities

  Accessibility is a cornerstone of the services offered at Calvary Assembly of
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God. The center features a **wheelchair-accessible car park** and a
**wheelchair-accessible entrance**, ensuring that everyone can access their
services without barriers.  

Meal Service and Activities

  The center provides a comprehensive **meal service** that caters to various
needs. From **grocery pickup** to meal delivery, individuals can experience a
variety of **service options** tailored to their circumstances. It’s important to
note that an **appointment is required** for some services, ensuring a smooth
and organized process.  

Community Support and Contributions

  Calvary Assembly of God is actively **accepting food donations** and
**accepting monetary donations** to support its mission. Community
involvement is crucial, and they are also **accepting new volunteers** to help
with ongoing efforts. As one visitor mentioned, “Everyone is so helpful and
gracious,” highlighting the warm atmosphere fostered by the staff and
volunteers alike.  

Feeling Welcome and Appreciated

  Visitors of the distribution center often feel a sense of belonging, as reflected in
feedback from the community. One attendee noted, “The minute I walked in the
church, I could tell it didn’t change; such a warm feeling.” This welcoming
environment is complemented by activities that engage and uplift those who
come through the doors.  

Eligibility Requirements and Assistance

  To receive assistance from the Food Distribution Center, individuals must meet
certain **eligibility requirements**. The staff is dedicated to guiding visitors
through this process, ensuring that they receive the support they need. As
another patron remarked, “Always there when you need help!”  

Conclusion

  The **Calvary Assembly of God - Food Distribution Center** in Dover is more
than just a food bank; it’s a community hub where support, care, and
compassion come together to create a positive impact. Whether you are
seeking assistance or wishing to contribute, this center welcomes you with open
arms. The overwhelming gratitude expressed by visitors reiterates the
importance of this facility in the lives of many.    
Our premises are located at

  
 1141 E Lebanon Rd, 19901  Dover, Delaware - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact line of the mentioned Food bank  is +1302-697-7776
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=39.1190341%2C-75.51367789999999#map=15/39.1190341/-75.51367789999999
tel:+1302-697-7776


 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1302-697-7776
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our opening hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–5?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–5?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–5?PM   Thursday 9?AM–5?PM   Friday 9?AM–5?PM   Saturday 9?AM–5?PM   Sunday 9?AM–5?PM           In case you want to update any information that you think is incorrect
regarding this site, please send us a message and we will correct it promptly.
With anticipation we appreciate it. 
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