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Mt. Salem United Methodist Church - Wilmington
   
Welcome to Mt. Salem United Methodist Church

  Mt. Salem United Methodist Church, located in Wilmington, Delaware, is not
just a place of worship; it is a community treasure that warmly embraces
everyone, including those with accessibility needs.   

Accessibility Features

  One of the standout features of Mt. Salem United Methodist Church is its
**wheelchair-accessible entrance** and **wheelchair-accessible car park**.
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These facilities ensure that all members of the community can participate in
worship and events without barriers. The church takes pride in its commitment
to **accessibility**, making it a welcoming space for everyone.  

On-Site Services and Community Involvement

  Mt. Salem hosts various **on-site services**, including liturgical worship
sessions that seek to serve the community at large. Many congregation
members appreciate the **service options** available, which include
opportunities for community engagement and support.  The church also has an
inviting atmosphere, highlighted by its beautiful stained glass windows and a
gorgeous pipe organ that enhances worship experiences. Many visitors have
commented on the cleanliness and spaciousness of the church, making it an
ideal venue for special occasions, such as birthday parties.  

The Warmth of the Congregation

  Visitors frequently mention the **warm and friendly congregation** at Mt.
Salem. Under the guidance of Pastor Kevin Benjamin, attendees feel embraced
and supported, creating a nurturing environment for worship. It truly is a place
where fellowship thrives, and everyone is welcomed with open arms.  

A Note on Health and Safety

  While many appreciate the vibrant atmosphere, it is important to recognize that
safety remains a priority. Some visitors have expressed concern regarding
mask-wearing among volunteers, emphasizing the importance of compassion
during these challenging times. As a place of worship, Mt. Salem encourages
everyone to love one another, which can extend to respecting health protocols
to ensure the safety of all attendees.  

Conclusion

  In conclusion, Mt. Salem United Methodist Church in Wilmington, Delaware,
stands as a beacon of hope and community spirit. With its
**wheelchair-accessible facilities**, dedication to community service, and a
welcoming environment, it is a beautiful place of worship where all can gather
and grow together. Whether you are attending a service or visiting the Tower
Treasures thrift shop, you're sure to find warmth and kindness in every corner.    
Our premises are located at

  
 2629 W 19th St, 19806  Wilmington, Delaware - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The phone number of this Church  is +1302-658-1807
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1302-658-1807
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We open at the following schedule:

    Day Hours    Monday Closed   Tuesday Closed   Wednesday Closed   Thursday Closed   Friday 8–9?AM 11?AM–12?PM   Saturday Closed   Sunday Closed        The website is Mt. Salem United Methodist Church       If necessary to update any detail that you consider is not precise related to
this web, we ask send a message and we will adjust it promptly. Thank you in
advance thank you very much. 
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